
TRT 3-20 0 Name --> No Bids

Product Tns MBF  Minimum 

Red Pine 142

Black Oak 6

Totals 148 0 $2,953.80 -$                             -$                                       -$                               -$                                   -$                                   -$                              -$                              -$                               

TRT 10-20 0 Name --> No Bid

Product Tns MBF  Minimum 

Oak 46

White Pine 32

Red Maple 2

Aspen 665

Oak 625

Red Pine 250

Mx Hdwd 210

White Pine 100

Jack Pine 80

Totals 1930 80 $25,264.00 -$                             -$                                       -$                               -$                                   -$                                   -$                              -$                              -$                               

TRT 14-20 0 Name -->
No Bid

Product Tns MBF  Minimum 

Black Oak 20

Mx Hdwd 4

White Pine 2.5

Black Oak 410

Mx Hdwd 250

Jack Pine 85

Totals 745 26.5 $7,770.50 -$                             -$                                       -$                               -$                                   -$                                   -$                              -$                              -$                               

TRT 15-20 3 Name -->
Byers Forestry  Martin Forestry Kron Forest Byers Forestry

Product Tns MBF  Minimum 

Red Pine 805 22.25$                          $                                  17.50 18.50$                          22.25$                              

Totals 805 0 $11,270.00 17,911.25$                 14,087.50$                          14,892.50$                  17,911.25$                      -$                                   -$                              -$                              -$                               

EAU CLAIRE COUNTY FOREST - December 10th, 2020 bid opening
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TRT 16-20 3 Name --> Martin Forestry  Walters Logging Bridge Creek Logging Martin Forestry

Product Tns MBF  Minimum 

White Pine 85 $160.00 $120.00 $125.00 $160.00

Black Oak 29 $200.00 $220.00 $175.00 $200.00

Mx Hdwd 2 $200.00 $220.00 $175.00 $200.00

Jack Pine 790 $12.20 $9.41 $10.00 $12.20

Black Oak 330 $6.50 $3.00 $7.00 $6.50

White Pine 210 $12.20 $9.52 $10.00 $12.20

Mx Hdwd 195 $6.50 $7.50 $7.00 $6.50

Aspen 175 $6.50 $8.88 $7.00 $6.50

Totals 1700 116 $28,237.00 36,550.00$                 30,459.60$                          30,950.00$                  36,550.00$                      -$                                   -$                              -$                              -$                               

TRT 17-20 4 Name --> Theodore J Strzok
NW Hardwoods

Walters Logging Theodore J Strzok Martin Forestry

Product Tns MBF  Minimum 

Red Oak 87 $400.00 $310.00 $370.00 $400.00 $300.00

White Oak 4 $400.00 $310.00 $370.00 $400.00 $300.00

Oak 559 $16.00 $9.00 $3.60 $16.00 $12.00

Red Pine 357 $24.00 $28.50 $15.77 $24.00 $19.00

MX Hdwd 352 $11.00 $9.00 $4.16 $11.00 $12.00

White Pine 72 $15.00 $18.50 $15.77 $15.00 $19.00

Totals 1340 91 $37,791.39 58,864.00$                 47,915.50$                          43,912.05$                  58,864.00$                      46,383.00$                      -$                              -$                              -$                               

TRT 18-20 1 Name -->
Tlusty Logging Tlusty Logging

Product Tns MBF  Minimum 

Red Oak 47 $345.00 $345.00

White Oak 13 $375.00 $375.00

Red Maple 7 $300.00 $300.00

Oak 500 $11.50 $11.50

Red Maple 330 $12.47 $12.47

Red Pine 170 $18.67 $18.67

White Pine 150 $18.67 $18.67

Totals 1150 67 $29,029.00 39,029.50$                 39,029.50$                          -$                               -$                                   -$                                   -$                              -$                              -$                               

TRT 19-20 2 Name --> Theodore Strzok Bridge Creek Logging Theodore Strzok

Product Tn/Cd MBF  Minimum 

Oak 76 $300.00 $265.00 $300.00

White Pine 18 $100.00 $150.00 $100.00

Mx Hdwd 8 $275.00 $265.00 $275.00

Oak Bolt (cd) 42 $29.00 $65.00 $29.00

Mx Hd Bolt (cd) 5 $29.00 $65.00 $29.00

Oak 350 $11.00 $5.00 $11.00

White PIne 100 $15.00 $10.00 $15.00

Mx Hdwd 300 $11.00 $5.00 $11.00

Totals 797 102 $24,581.70 36,813.00$                 32,265.00$                          36,813.00$                  -$                                   -$                                   -$                              -$                              -$                               



EAU CLAIRE COUNTY FOREST - December 10th, 2020 bid opening

TRT 20-20 7 Name --> NW Hardwoods Tigerton Lumber Co Tlusty Logging Inc Twin Forest Country Forest NW Hardwoods Nicholas Syryzuk Theodore Strzok Byers Forestry

Product Tns MBF  Minimum 

Red Oak 215 $450.00 $302.00 $418.00 $370.00 $376.00 $450.00 $405.00 $415.00 $365.00

White Oak 20 $450.00 $320.00 $418.00 $350.00 $501.00 $450.00 $405.00 $415.00 $365.00

Oak 1042 $13.52 $6.45 $16.77 $11.00 $10.00 $13.52 $4.60 $16.00 $13.90

Totals 1042 235 $75,125.05 119,837.84$              78,050.90$                          115,704.34$                98,012.00$                      101,280.00$                    119,837.84$               99,968.20$                  114,197.00$                100,258.80$                

TRT 21-20 3 Name --> Bridge Creek Logging Walters Logging Bridge Creek Logging Byers Forestry

Product Tns MBF  Minimum 

Black Oak 84 $250.00 $200.00 $250.00 $200.00

White Oak 24 $250.00 $200.00 $250.00 $200.00

Mx Hdwd 20 $250.00 $200.00 $250.00 $200.00

Mx Hdwd 721 $7.00 $2.00 $7.00 $2.70

White Pine 492 $16.50 $7.14 $16.50 $2.70

Oak 239 $7.00 $1.00 $7.00 $2.70

Totals 1452 128 $29,289.66 46,838.00$                 30,793.88$                          46,838.00$                  29,520.40$                      -$                                   -$                              -$                              -$                               

TRT 22-20 4 Name --> Bridge Creek Logging Tlusty Logging Bridge Creek Logging Byers Forestry Kron Forest Prod

Product Tns MBF  Minimum 

Oak 18.5 $200.00 $285.00 $200.00 $200.00 $200.00

Mx Hdwd 2.5 $200.00 $285.00 $200.00 $200.00 $200.00

Red Pine 1000 $30.51 $20.73 $30.51 $28.90 $26.00

Aspen 770 $5.00 $12.50 $5.00 $1.00 $11.00

Mx Hdwd 320 $10.00 $12.37 $10.00 $1.00 $10.00

Oak 250 $10.00 $12.37 $10.00 $1.00 $10.00

Jack Pine 38 $10.00 $17.50 $10.00 $1.00 $4.00

Totals 2378 21 $34,086.60 44,640.00$                 44,055.90$                          44,640.00$                  34,478.00$                      44,522.00$                      -$                              -$                              -$                               

TRT 23-20 6 Name --> Theordore Strzok Nicholas Syryczuk NW Hardwoods Country Forest Prod Tlusky Logging Theordore Strzok Byers Forestry

Product Tns MBF  Minimum 

Oak 154 $385.00 $382.50 $390.00 $285.00 $300.00 $385.00 $360.00

White Oak 69.5 $385.00 $382.50 $420.00 $425.00 $350.00 $385.00 $385.00

Red Maple 11 $300.00 $382.50 $310.00 $285.00 $285.00 $300.00 $360.00

Oak 2030 $16.00 $10.00 $11.00 $2.00 $12.57 $16.00 $15.20

Red Maple 420 $12.00 $6.50 $11.00 $5.00 $13.53 $12.00 $15.20

White Pine 10 $15.00 $3.00 $3.00 $3.00 $10.50 $15.00 $15.20

Totals 2460 234.5 $78,628.00 127,017.50$              112,756.25$                        119,640.00$                82,752.50$                      104,964.70$                    127,017.50$               123,549.50$               
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TRT 13-19 0 Name --> No Bids

Product Tns MBF  Minimum 

White Pine 4

Oak 2

Aspen 110

Oak 110

Mx Hdwd 100

Jack Pine 40

White Pine 15

Totals 375 6 $3,751.00 -$                             -$                                       -$                               -$                                   -$                                   -$                              -$                              -$                               



TIMBER SALE BID RESULTS       December 10 2020

EAU CLAIRE COUNTY FOREST

Trct # Qualified Non Q Advertised Value Bid Value

3-20 0 $2,953.80 -$                 

10-20 0 $25,264.00 -$                 

14-20 0 $7,770.50 -$                 

15-20 3 $11,270.00 17,911.25$     

16-20 3 $28,237.00 36,550.00$     

17-20 4 $37,791.39 58,864.00$     

18-20 1 $29,029.00 39,029.50$     

19-20 2 $24,581.70 36,813.00$     

20-20 7 $75,125.05 119,837.84$   

21-20 3 $29,289.66 46,838.00$     

22-20 4 $34,086.60 44,640.00$     

23-20 6 $78,628.00 127,017.50$   

13-19 0 $3,751.00 -$                 

14-19 0 $3,924.01 -$                 

Total 33 0 $391,701.71 $527,501.09

NW Hardwoods

No Bids

Advertised Value of Sales Sold

No Bids

Number of Sales Sold 9

No Bids

14Number of Sales Offered

Theodore Strzok

TOTALS     

Theodore J Strzok

# of Loggers Bidding

Difference of Advertised & Sold Values 179,462.69$                       

Value of Sales Sold

Theordore Strzok

527,501.09$                       

$348,038.40

52%

Bridge Creek Logging

Bridge Creek Logging

Fall Bid Opening 2020

# of Bids

High Bidder

No Bid

No Bid

Tlusty Logging

Byers Forestry

Martin Forestry
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