2021 PRICE COUNTY FOREST TIMBER SALES (Spring)

Tract	Aspen Acres	NH Acres	Other Acres	Hwd Volume	Aspen Volume	BW Volume	Bass Volume	Balsam Volume	Spruce Volume	Tamarack Volume	Pine Volume	Log Volume (MBF)	Advertised Value	Sold Value	% Above Minimum
7-19	42	44	20 (SH)	2,150	900	100						25	\$34,840.00	\$0.00	-100%
9-20	16		87 (SH)	1,600	250			70				7	\$14,005.00	\$0.00	-100%
16-20		105		1,250			40					45	\$17,900.00	\$0.00	-100%
18-20	9	100		2,100	230	· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·	30					28	\$27,963.00	\$0.00	-100%
1-21	97			280	3,150	90							\$44,650.00	\$50,950.00	14%
2-21	52			70	975	15		With Vi					\$13,525.00	\$15,881.75	17%
3-21	7	67		1,750	230		20	85			,	43	\$27,295.00	\$28,193.00	3%
4-21		60		1,500	25							70	\$25,625.00	\$32,405.00	26%
5-21	57			340	2,250		*						\$32,650.00	\$53,735.00	65%
6-21	59	22		1,600	1,250		90	***************************************	·			112	\$48,400.00	\$0.00	-100%
7-21	54	,		110	2,250				80:				\$31,230.00	\$54,220.00	74%
8-21	43			1,000	900							6	\$22,540.00	\$22,730.00	1%
9-21			187 (FB) 4 (PJ)	2,500	400	950	15	1,150	140	110	210	42	\$38,209.00	\$0.00	-100%
10-21	- 90			2,250	3,100							18	\$65,320.00	\$0.00	-100%
11-21	31			340	1,100							6	\$18,820.00	\$21,020.00	12%
12-21	66			100	2,150			_					\$28,950.00	\$33,250.00	15%
13-21	43			· 55	1,900								\$25,250.00	\$48,732.00	93%
15-21	32			90	500	190		190	20				\$10,470.00	\$16,380.00	56%
TOTALS 1	698	398	107(SH) 187 (FB) 4 (PJ)	19,085	21,560	1,155	195	1,305	220	110	210	402	\$527,642.00	\$377,496.75	-28%

Sales with unimproved access	\$376,308.00	\$188,548.00	-50%
Sales with roadside or Improved access	\$151,334.00	\$188,948.75	25%

¹³⁹⁴ Acres established (106 - 2019 acres, 317 - 2020 acres, 971 - 2021 acres) -Pulp volume is listed as tons

Price County Timber Sale Bid Results -- May 4, 2021

*denotes successful bidder

				*deno
Tract 7-19				
Mxd Hardwood	2,150 tons	\$9.50		NO BID
Aspen	900 tons	\$11.00		
White Birch	100 tons	\$10.10		
Mx Hwd Logs	20 MBF	\$120.00		
MH Logs	5 MBF	\$221.00		
Total Bid		\$34,840.00	\$0.00	
Tract 9-20 Mxd Hardwood	1,600 tons	\$6.50		NO BID
Aspen	250 tons	\$9.80		
Balsam Fir	70 tons	\$4.50		
Mx Hwd Logs	7 MBF	\$120.00		
Total Bid		\$14,005.00	\$0.00	
		r		
Tract 16-20				NO BID
Mxd Hardwood	1,250 tons	\$9.50		
Basswood Pulp	40 tons	\$3.00		
MH Logs	5 MBF	\$221.00		
Mx Hwd Logs	40 MBF	\$120.00		
Total Bid		\$17,900.00	\$0.00	
		Г	<u> </u>	
Tract 18-20				NO BID
Mxd Hardwood	2,100 tons	\$9.50		
Aspen	230 tons	\$11.10		
Basswood	30 tons	\$2.00		
Mxd Hwd Logs	45 MBF	\$120.00		
Total Bid		\$27,963.00	\$0.00	

Tract 1-21			Lake States Timber	Schloer Logging
Aspen	3,150 tons	\$13.00	\$15.00	\$13.00
Mx Hwd	280 tons	\$10.00	\$10.00	\$10.00
White Birch	90 tons	\$10.00	\$10.00	\$10.05
Total Bid		\$44,650.00	\$50,950.00	\$44,654.50

Tract 2-21			Futurewood	Schloer Logging
Mxd Hardwood	70 tons	\$10.00	\$11.00	\$10.50
Aspen	975 tons	\$13.00	\$15.33	\$15.00
White Birch	15 tons	\$10.00	\$11.00	\$11.00
Total Bid		\$13,525.00	\$15,881.75	\$15,525.00

Tract 3-21				Dale Raleigh
Aspen	230	tons	\$13.00	\$13.10
Mxd Hardwood	1,750	tons	\$10.00	\$10.50
Balsam	85	tons	\$5.00	\$5.00
Basswood	20	tons	\$3.00	\$3.00
Mxd Hwd Logs	40	MBF	\$140.00	\$140.00
MH Logs	3	MBF	\$240.00	\$240.00
Total Bid			\$27,295.00	\$28,193.00

Tract 4-21	Whole Tree	Whole Tree	Fink Forest Products
Mxd Hardwood	1,950 tons	\$7.60	\$11.00
Aspen	30 tons	\$10.80	\$11.00
Mx Hwd Logs	65 мвг	\$140.00	\$145.00
MH Logs	5 MBF	\$240.00	\$240.00
Total Bid		\$25,444.00	\$32,405.00

Tract 5-21			Schloer Logging	Fink Forest Products	Flannel Fleet Logging LLC	R.M. Bay Logging Inc	Bruce Burmeister	Wiitala and Vozka	Lake States Timber	Futurewood	Tony Smugala
Aspen	2,250 tons	\$13.00	\$22.22	\$13.50	\$16.50	\$16.20	\$15.65	\$15.00	\$15.00	\$14.03	\$13.05
Mxd Hardwood	340 tons	\$10.00	\$11.00	\$1 3.50	\$11.00	\$10.00	\$10.00	\$11.00	\$10.00	\$10.22	\$10.00
Total Bid		\$32,650.00	\$53,735.00	\$45,090.00	\$40,865.00	\$39,850.00	\$38,612.50	\$37,490.00	\$37,150.00	\$35,042.30	\$32,762.50

Whole Tree

					-
Tract 6-21 Mx Hwd Logs 110 MBF \$140.00 MH Logs 2 MBF \$240.00 Aspen 1,250 tons \$13.00 Mxd Harriwood 1,600 tons \$10.00					
Mx Hwd Logs	110	MBF	\$140.00		
MH Logs	2	MBF	\$240.00		
Aspen	1,250	tons	\$13.00		
Mxd Hardwood	1,600	tons	\$10.00		
Basswood	90	tons	\$3.00		
Total Bid	,,		\$48,400.00	\$0.0	— 00

NO BIDS

Tract 7-21			Schloer Logging	Flannel Fleet Logging LLC	R.M. Bay Logging Inc	Lake States Timber	Bruce Burmeister	Futurewood
Aspen	2,250 tons	\$13.00	\$23.00	\$17.50	\$17.00	\$15.00	\$15.65	\$14.03
Mxd Hardwood	110 tons	\$10.00	\$13.00	\$11.00	\$10.00	\$10.00	\$10.00	\$10.00
White Spruce	80 tons	\$11.00	\$13.00	\$12.00	\$12.00	\$11.00	\$14.00	\$11.27
Total Bid		\$31,230.00	\$54,220.00	\$41,545.00	\$40,310.00	\$35,730.00	\$37,432.50	\$33,569.10

Tract 8-21			Dale Raleigh
Aspen	900 tons	\$13.00	\$13.10
Mxd Hardwood	1,000 tons	\$10.00	\$10.10
Mx Hwd Logs	6 мвг	\$140.00	\$140.00
Total Bid		\$22,540.00	\$22,730.00

				·
Tract 9-21				
Mx Hardwood	2,500	tons	\$7.00	
Balsam	1,150	tons	\$3.50	
White Birch	950	tons	\$7.00	
White Spruce	140	tons	\$7.70	
Aspen	400	tons	\$9.10	
Tamarack	110	tons	\$3.50	
Scotch Pine	210	tons	\$3.00	
Basswood	15	tons	\$3.00	
Mx Hwd Logs	40	MBF	\$98.00	
MH Logs	2	MBF	\$168.00	
Total Bid			\$38,209.00	\$0.00

NO BIDS

M			
Tract 10-21			
Mxd Hardwood	2,250 tons	\$10.00	
Aspen	3,100 tons	\$13.00	
Mx Hwd Logs	18 MBF	\$140.00	
Total Bid		\$65,320.00	\$0.00

NO BIDS

Tract 11-21			Lake States Timber	Tony Smugala	Schloer Logging
Mxd Hardwood	340 tons	\$10.00	\$10.00	\$12.00	\$10.00
Aspen	1,100 tons	\$13.00	\$15.00	\$14.00	\$13.05
Mx Hwd Logs	8 мвг	\$140.00	\$140.00	\$160.00	\$140.00
Total Bid		\$18,820.00	\$21,020.00	\$20,760.00	\$18,875.00

Tract 12-21			Lake States Timber	Futurewood	Bruce Burmeister	Schloer Logging
Aspen	2,150 tons	\$13.00	\$15.00	\$14.71	\$13.91	\$13.00
Mxd Hardwood	100 tons	\$10.00	\$10.00	\$12.55	\$10.00	\$10.05
Total Bid		\$28,950.00	\$33,250.00	\$32,881.50	\$30,906.50	\$28,955.00

Tract 13-21			Schloer Logging	Futurewood	Fink Forest Products	Kestler Logging Inc	Wiitala and Vozka	Bruce Burmeister	Lake States Timber
Aspen	1,900 tons	\$13.00	\$25.33	\$18.08	\$13.50	\$17.26	\$16.00	\$15.25	\$15.00
Mxd Hardwood	55 tons	\$10.00	\$11.00	\$10.66	\$13.50	\$10.50	\$12.00	\$10.00	\$10.00
Total Bid		\$25,250.00	\$48,732.00	\$34,938.30	\$34,020.00	\$33,371.50	\$31,060.00	\$29,525.00	\$29,050.00

Whole Tree

Tract 15-21				Schloer Logging
Mxd Hardwood	90	tons	\$10.00	\$10.00
Aspen	500	tons	\$13.00	\$24.44
White Birch	190	tons	\$10.00	\$10.00
Balsam	190	tons	\$5.00	\$6.00
White Spruce	20	tons	\$11.00	\$11.00
Total Bid			\$10,470.00	\$16,380.00